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King Gilgamesh, in the cradle of civilization (3500 B.C), wrestles with the fact that he is two-thirds god and
one-third man. The gods have granted him Herculean power and wit but withheld his wish for immortality.
Gilgamesh will do anything to bring the Heavens to the Underworld. The gods intercede with a great man-
beast challenger from the forest to quell the raging king. This sweeping epic of visceral violence and power
also pits the Great King Gilgamesh against The Bull of Heaven and Humbaba, the Protector of The Cedar
Forest.

Gilgamesh is the goring wild bull, in all of us, seeking control or relevance at the expense of others or even
ourselves. What he learns of life, love and happiness is relevant to all of us. Most importantly, his story is
one of the first recorded in human history...and reminds us that our forefathers may have seen life with a
greater clarity than our own.

This treatment, for the first time, imagines the classic Gilgamesh story for a modern day audience.
Researched and crafted by R. Glen Setchfield, the basis of this book was a number of short English
translations of the original cuneiform tablets. Exhaustive anthropological research surrounding the pieces of
cuneiform stone tablets were also the basis for this story. In the end, this adaptation faithfully expands upon
the original folk tale’s themes.

Characters, scenes, action and dialogue have all been added to round out the author’s interest in
communicating the themes still relevant to a modern day audience fascinated with youth, immortality,
control and interpersonal/social relevance.
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From reader reviews:

Diane Reid:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important work, like
looking for your favorite e-book and reading a publication. Beside you can solve your condition; you can add
your knowledge by the reserve entitled The Epic of Gilgamesh. Try to stumble through book The Epic of
Gilgamesh as your close friend. It means that it can to get your friend when you truly feel alone and beside
associated with course make you smarter than before. Yeah, it is very fortuned for you. The book makes you
much more confidence because you can know every little thing by the book. So , let us make new experience
along with knowledge with this book.

Courtney Cook:

This The Epic of Gilgamesh are usually reliable for you who want to be described as a successful person,
why. The explanation of this The Epic of Gilgamesh can be on the list of great books you must have is
definitely giving you more than just simple examining food but feed a person with information that might be
will shock your prior knowledge. This book will be handy, you can bring it almost everywhere and whenever
your conditions both in e-book and printed types. Beside that this The Epic of Gilgamesh giving you an
enormous of experience like rich vocabulary, giving you test of critical thinking that we all know it useful in
your day exercise. So , let's have it appreciate reading.

Duane Zook:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray you actually, why because this The Epic of Gilgamesh publication
written by well-known writer who really knows well how to make book that could be understand by anyone
who have read the book. Written throughout good manner for you, leaking every ideas and composing skill
only for eliminate your hunger then you still question The Epic of Gilgamesh as good book not merely by the
cover but also by the content. This is one e-book that can break don't evaluate book by its include, so do you
still needing a different sixth sense to pick this specific!? Oh come on your reading sixth sense already
alerted you so why you have to listening to another sixth sense.

Ethel Springer:

Is it a person who having spare time then spend it whole day by means of watching television programs or
just resting on the bed? Do you need something new? This The Epic of Gilgamesh can be the respond to, oh
how comes? It's a book you know. You are therefore out of date, spending your free time by reading in this
fresh era is common not a geek activity. So what these publications have than the others?
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